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NATURES BEST® ROASTERS

SUPERIOR MERCHANDISING TO INCREASE SALES!

The ultimate rotisserie merchandisers in assorted sizes designed to fit whole chickens, turkey breasts,
baked hams, and many other main course entrees. Nature’s Best Roasters utilize advanced engineering
techniques, resulting in bases with a 40% reduction in oil-based resins, and wide panel, clear lids providing
structurally stronger packages. The lids support the weight of stacked packages in a shopping cart or bag
without hampering the unique venting design. Leak-resistant closures eliminate the need to wrap with film
or tape to prevent messy spills. Double vents allow steam to escape freely while the unique formula of the
anti-fog material reduces condensation buildup keeping the food inside looking fresh ans appealing.

NATURE'S BEST® 4110600 SKU: 4110600

9.5" x 7.5" Combo Pack Large Roaster

Microwavable Black Base

And Clear Anti-Fog High PP Lid

Dimensions: 9.44" x 7.51" x 4.5" / 24cm x 19.1cm x 11.4cm

Case Pack: 170 / 170

Case Weight: 20.50 lbs / 9.3 kg

Case Cube: 3.97 ft3 / .11m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/4110600/
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MICRORAVES® TWO-PIECE PACKAGES

ENDLESS OPTIONS TO MERCHANDISE AND DELIVER PREPARED FOODS!

Packaging that Performs. Two-piece microwavable polypropylene bases and lids in oval and rectangle
shapes that withstand temperatures to 230℉ in hot grab and go displays, under heat lamps and in the
microwave. Many sizes also offer high-clarity PETE lids to drive impulse sales from refrigerated cases of
fully prepared meals to be reheated in the microwave at home or office. Anti-fog lids in both PP and PETE
options keep the food shining through and avoids errors. Unique designs promote structural integrity with
leak-resistant closures and table-ready presentations in durable, cut-resistant material.

MICRORAVES® CDM710-LC710D SKU: 4117110

10" x 7" Combo Pack 32 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

And 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog RPET Lid

Dimensions: 10.25" x 7.25" x 2.16" / 26.04cm x 18.42cm x 5.49cm

Case Pack: 126 / 126

Case Weight: 15.44 lbs / 7.01kg

Case Cube: 3.18 ft3 / 0.09m3

MICRORAVES® M713B SKU: 4540713

10" x 7" Container 15/5/5 oz

Microwavable 3-Comp. Black Base

Dimensions: 10.25" X 7.25" X 1.34" /26.04cm x 18.42cm x 3.4cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 16.54 lbs / 7.51kg

Case Cube: 3.32 ft3 / 0.09m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cdm710-lc710d/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m713b/
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MICRORAVES® LH713 SKU: 4330713

10" x 7" Lid

Microwavable 3-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog

Fits M713B

Dimensions: 10.25" X 7.25" X 1.08"/ 26.04cm x 18.42cm x 2.74cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 14.87 lbs / 6.75kg

Case Cube: 2.42 ft3 / 0.07m3

MICRORAVES® M416 SKU: 4541602

9" x 6" Container 16 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

Dimensions: 8.79" x 6.35" x 1.24" / 22.33cm x 16.13cm x 3.15cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 14.14 lbs / 6.42kg

Case Cube: 2.08 ft3 / 0.06m3

MICRORAVES® M424 SKU: 4542402

9" x 6" Container 24 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

Dimensions: 8.79" x 6.35" x 1.72" / 22.33cm x 16.13cm x 4.37cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 15.51 lbs / 7.0kg

Case Cube: 2.15 ft3 / 0.06m3

MICRORAVES® M432 SKU: 4543200

9" x 6" Container 32 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

Dimensions: 8.79" x 6.35" x 2.15" / 22.33cm x 16.13cm x 5.46cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 16.68 lbs / 7.57kg

Case Cube: 2.19 ft3 / 0.06m3

MICRORAVES® LC4LD SKU: 4304002

9" x 6" Lid

Clear Cold Anti-Fog

Fits M416, M424, M432, M420-2

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/lh713/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m416/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m424/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m432/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/lc4ld/
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MICRORAVES® LH4LD SKU: 4334003

9" x 6" Lid

Microwavable Clear Anti-Fog

Fits M416, M424, M432, M420-2

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/lh4ld/
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CULINARY SQUARES® CONTAINERS AND LIDS

LOW COST ALTERNATIVES TO FOAM CLAMSHELLS!

Culinary Squares® black polypropylene containers wth separate clear lids withstand temperatures to
230℉ for use under heat lamps, in warming units and microwaves. Clear, anti-fog, vented lids allow
excess steam to dissipate keeping the food visible to eliminate order errors and increases impulse sales
from grab & go displays. These 8.5" square bases and lids are available separately or in combo packs.
Affordable options to upgrade with the same inside food space as foam clamshells. Mix and match the one
and three-compartment bases and lids.

CULINARY SQUARES® CDCS85321-CS85LHX1 GINSBERG: 66597
8" Square Combo Pack 36 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

And 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Deep PP Lid

Dimensions: 8.46" x 8.46" x 2.91" / 21.49cm x 21.49cm x 7.39cm

Case Pack: 150/150

Case Weight: 20.40 lbs / 9.25kg

Case Cube: 2.99 ft3 / 0.08m3

SKU: 4118515

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cdcs85321-cs85lhx1/
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CRYSTAL CLASSICS® BOWLS AND LIDS

SUPERIOR CLARITY LET'S YOU SEE AND TASTE FRESHNESS!

Round and square salad bowls available in black or clear post-consumer recycled PET. Excellent structural
strength to stand up to cold temperatures and won’t break even when dropped. Inner/outer double-seal
provides optimal leak-resistance. Large textured tabs on the bowl and lid, provide easy opening features
for customers. An interlocking feature on the bowl and lid assures positive stacking on display or in the
bag.

CRYSTAL CLASSICS® CP832 SKU: 4548100

8" Square Bowl 32 oz

Black

Dimensions: 8.13" x 8.13" x 1.75" / 20.6cm x 20.6cm x 4.4cm

Case Pack: 150

Case Weight: 8.96 lbs / 4.06kg

Case Cube: 1.22 ft3 / 0.03m3

CRYSTAL CLASSICS® CP800 SKU: 4308100

8" Square Bowl Lid

Clear, Fits CP832 , CPS832C,

CPS848, CPS848C

Dimensions: 8.13" x 8.13" x .97" / 20.65cm x 20.65cm x 2.46cm

Case Pack: 150

Case Weight: 8.10 lbs / 3.7kg

Case Cube: 1.22ft3 / 0.03m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cp832/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cp800/
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MEGA-MEAL® HALF STEAM CONTAINERS

UPSCALE BLACK BASES AND CLEAR LIDS DRESS UP ANY EVENT!

Family serving size, containers in 80 and 100 ounce capacities with one clear, leak-resistant lid to fit both.
Similar size to the half-size steam pans popular in catering and buffets. Excellent for use in steam tables*
when used in hot water trays. Sturdy, rigid base is made with 40% less oil-based resin with natural
additives.  The clear, anti-fog lid provides food visibility without opening, keeping the contents fresh until
serving time. Packages withstand temperatures to 230℉ under heat lamps, in warming units, catering hot
boxes, or microwaves. *Not for use in direct contact with sterno flame.

MEGA-MEAL® M1200 SKU: 4542100

12" x 10" Container 100 oz

Microwavable Black Half Steam Pan

Family Size

Dimensions: 12.38" x 10.25" x 2.56" / 31.5cm x 26cm x 6.5cm

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 18.52 lbs / 8.4kg

Case Cube: 2.74 ft3 / .08m3

MEGA-MEAL® LH1200 SKU: 4332000

12" x 10" Lid

Microwavable Clear Anti-Fog

Half Steam, Fits M1200, M1280

Dimensions: 12.38" x 10.25" x 1.22" / 31.5cm x 26cm x 3.1cm

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 11.21 lbs / 5.08kg

Case Cube: 2.06 ft3 / .06m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m1200/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/lh1200/
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INCREDI-BOWLS® M7240 SKU: 4607240

 7.25" Round Bowl 40 oz

Microwavable Bowl Black

Dimensions: 7.25" diameter x 3.27" / 18.42cm x 8.31cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 18.04lbs / 8.18kg

Case Cube: 2.591ft3 / 0.07m3

INCREDI-BOWLS® LH7200-252 SKU: 4337216

7.25" Round Bowl Lid

Microwavable Clear Anti-Fog

Fits M7220, M7224, M7228, M7232, M7240

Dimensions: 7.25" diameter x .64" / 18.42cm x 1.63cm

Case Pack: 252

Case Weight: 9.79 lbs / 4.44kg

Case Cube: 2.22 ft3 / 0.06m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/m7240/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/lh7200-252/
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CULINARY CLASSICS® PREMIUM HINGED CONTAINERS

BEST HINGED CONTAINERS FOR HOT FOOD TO GO IN THE MARKET!

Culinary Classics® Premium hinged packages withstand temperatures up to 230℉ for use under heat
lamps, in warming units and microwaves. Clear, anti-fog, vented lids allow excess steam to dissipate
keeping the food visible to eliminate order errors and increases impulse sales from grab & go displays.
Secure stack in bags and leak-resistant closure prevents messy spills while ensuring freshness. Tear-away
“convertible lid” provides a table-ready presentation ready to eat from the cut-resistant polypropylene
base. Available in 9" x 9" and 10.5" x 9.5" in one and three-compartments; 9" x 6" in one and two-
compartments. The 6" x 6" available in the Culinary Basics® line.

CULINARY CLASSICS® CC6911 SKU: 4656910

9" x 6" Hinged Container 26 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

With 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Lid

Dimensions: 9.55" x 6.49" x 3.21" / 24.3cm x 16.5cm x 8.2cm

Case Pack: 120

Case Weight: 13.20 lbs / 6.0kg

Case Cube: 2.51 ft3 / .07m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/culinary-classics-cc6911/
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CULINARY BASICS® HINGED CONTAINERS

PERFECT HINGED CONTAINER SOLUTION FOR HOT FOOD TO GO!

Culinary Basics® hinged packages withstand temperatures up to 230℉ for use under heat lamps, in
warming units and microwaves. Clear, anti-fog, vented lids allow excess steam to dissipate keeping the
food visible to eliminate order errors and increases impulse sales from grab & go displays. Secure stack in
bags and leak-resistant closure prevents messy spills while ensuring freshness. Available in 6" x 6" with
black or clear base; 9" x 9" and 10.5" x 9.5" in black bases. See Culinary Classics® and Culinary Lites®
hinged containers for additional sizes and 3-compartment options.

CULINARY BASICS® CB9911B

SKU: 46699119" x 9" Hinged Container 36 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

With 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Lid

Dimensions: 9.06" x 9.06" x 2.74" / 23.01cm x 23.01cm x 6.96cm

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 13.36 lbs / 6.06kg

Case Cube: 2.97 ft3 / .08 m3

CULINARY BASICS® CB91011B

SKU: 466911110.5" x 9.5" Hinged Container 46.5 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

With 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Lid

Dimensions: 10.5" x 9.5" x 2.5" / 26.67cm x 24.13cm x 6.35m

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 15.02 lbs / 6.8 kg

Case Cube: 3.41 ft3 / .10 m3

GINSBERG: 66595

GINSBERG: 66594

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cb9911b/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cb91011b/
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CULINARY LITES® VALUE HINGED CONTAINERS

BEST VALUE HINGED CONTAINERS FOR HOT FOOD TO GO IN THE MARKET!

Culinary Lites® Value hinged packages withstand temperatures up to 230℉ for use under heat lamps, in
warming units and microwaves. Clear, anti-fog, vented lids allow excess steam to dissipate keeping the
food visible to eliminate order errors and increases impulse sales from grab & go displays. Secure stack in
bags and leak-resistant closure prevents messy spills while ensuring freshness. These Nature’s Best®
hinged containers are made with less polypropylene resin yet durable and cut-resistant. Available in 9" x
9" and 10.5" x 9.5" in one and three-comparments; 9" x 6" one-compartment. The 6" x 6" available in the
Culinary Basics® line.

CULINARY LITES® CL9911 SKU: 4699911

9" x 9" Hinged Container 39 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

With 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Tear-Away Lid

Dimensions: 9.48" x 9.06" x 3.01" / 24.08cm x 23.01cm x 7.65cm

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 13.75 lbs / 6.24kg

Case Cube: 3.23 ft3 / .09 m3

CULINARY LITES® CL91011 SKU: 4699610

10.5" x 9.5" Hinged Container 47.5 oz

Microwavable 1-Comp. Black Base

With 1-Comp. Clear Anti-Fog Tear-Away Lid

Dimensions: 10.56" x 9.98" x 3.18" / 26.82cm x 25.35cm x 8.08cm

Case Pack: 100

Case Weight: 15.36 lbs / 6.97kg

Case Cube: 3.84 ft3 / 0.11m3

https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cl9911/
https://www.anchorpackaging.com/product/cl91011/



